
East Lothian Council
FOI Ref: 2018/208

I would like to request the following information for public health funerals (for 1 March 2017 to the 

1) Name of the deceased
2) Date of birth
3) Date of death
4) Last residential address
5) Have the next of kin/ family members been traced?
6) What date has the details been transferred to the QLTR, Bona Vacantia, Treasury Solicitor, 
Government Legal Department, National Ultimus Haeres or Duchy?
7) Name and contact details of the department/council officer who refers such cases to the the  QLTR, 
Bona Vacantia, Treasury Solicitor, Government Legal Department, National Ultimus Haeres or Duchy.

Please refer to the tables overleaf.



Year Client Name Date of Death Age at Death Date of Birth Marital Status Maiden Surmame        (if 
Recorded)

Address @ Date of Death

2017 Emma Anderson                     (AKA 
Emma Cosgrove) 

03 March 2017 68 26 June 1948 Single Information not held* Tranent Nursing Home, 1 Coal Neuk Court, Tranent, 
East Lothian EH33 1DR

2017 Jessie Ferrie 09 March 2017 75 16 August 1941 Information not held* Information not held* 21 Ashgrove, Musselburgh, East Lothian, EH21 7LS

2017 Catherine Ford 12 March 2017 91 07 December 1925 Single Information not held* Garden House Residential Home,174 Main Street 
Spittal, Berwick-Upon-Tweed TD15 1RD

2017 Stuart Forsyth 03 May 2017 43 03 May 1974 Single N/A 82d High Street, Dunbar, East Lothian EH42 1JH
2017 Stacey O'Rourke 25 May 2017 40 11 October 1976 Information not held* Information not held* 18 North Grange Avenue, Prestonpans
2017 Ann Young                                (AKA 

Mary Agnes Young)
20 July 2017 92 15 March 1925 Information not held* Information not held* Drummohr Nursing Home, 47a Drummohr Gardens 

Wallyford Musselburgh East Lothian EH21 8BH

2017 Mary McGowan 25 July 2017 94 26 February 1923 Information not held* Information not held* Drummohr Nursing Home, 47a Drummohr Gardens 
Wallyford Musselburgh East Lothian EH21 8BH

2017 Sylvia Williams 15 August 2017 70 08 July 1947 Information not held* Information not held* Adamswood Nursing Home, 47C Ravensheugh 
Road, Musselburgh EH21 7PY

2017 Sheila Green 06 September 2017 82 22 May 1935 Information not held* Information not held* Eskgreen Retirement Home, 10 Shorthope Street, 
Musselburgh, East Lothian EH21 7DB

2017 Arthur Smith 20 September 2017 81 15 May 2018 Information not held* N/A Tranent Nursing Home, 1 Coal Neuk Court, Tranent, 
East Lothian EH33 1DR

2017 Elizabeth McGhee 03 October 2017 50 29 November 1966 Information not held* Information not held* 36 Steading View, Tranent, East Lothian EH33 2AQ

2017 Donald Coward 08 October 2017 87 31 December 1929 Information not held* N/A Eskgreen Retirement Home, 10 Shorthope Street, 
Musselburgh, East Lothian EH21 7DB

2017 Colin Mitchell 28 October 2017 63 19 April 1954 Information not held* N/A 6 Edenhall Road, Musselburgh, East Lothian, EH21 
7JU

2017 Norman Stalker 30 October 2017 70 13 March 1947 Information not held* N/A 10 Stoneybank Road, Musselburgh, East Lothian 
EH21 6HJ

*In view of this, under Section 17(1)(b) of the Act, I must formally advise you that ELC has been unable to comply with your request as the information you require is not held.



Year Client Name Date of Death Age at Death Date of Birth Marital Status Maiden Surname (if 
Recorded) Address @ Date of Death

2018 Adam Anderson 26/01/2018 16/03/1900 18/12/1941 Information not held* N/A 87 Summerfield Road, Dunbar, East Lothian, 
EH32 1NL

*In view of this, under Section 17(1)(b) of the Act, I must formally advise you that ELC has been unable to comply with your request as the information you require is not held.
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