East Lothian Council
FOI Ref: 2018/218

I would like information on people dying with no next of kin being known, from 1/9/17 to the day of your response to this request. If someone died before 1/9/17 but the case has only come to your attention since, could you please also include details, as follows:

1. Surnames and forenames or initials

2. Dates of death

3. Age at death or date of birth

4. Place of birth

5. Marital status

6. Maiden surnames of married or widowed women

7. Usual address at time of death

8. Approx. value of their estate if known

9. The date you sent information to the NUHU or Q&LTR or any other third
party firm or department or organisation, or confirmation that this action was
not applicable.

10. If you have yet to send the information on, as per 9 above, or a decision
has not yet been made whether or not to do so, please also advise of this.

Sheila Green Arthur Smith Elizabeth McGhee Donald Coward Colin Mitchell Norman Stalker Adam Anderson
06 September 2017 20 September 2017 03 October 2017 08 October 2017 28 October 2017 30 October 2017 26/01/2018
22 May 1935 16 May 1936 29 November 1966 21 December 1929 19 April 1954 13 March 1947 18-Dec-41

This information is not held*.
This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*. N/A This information is not held*. N/A N/A N/A N/A

Eskgreen Residential Home Tranent Care Home 1 Coal |36 Steading View Eskgreen Residential Home 6 Edenhall Road 10 Stoneybank Road

10 Shorthope Street Neuk Court Tranent Tranent 10 Shorthope Street Musselburgh Musselburgh

Musselburgh East East Lothian EH33 East Lothian Musselburgh East East Lothian East Lothian 87 Summerfield Road, Dunbar,
Lothian EH21 7DB 1DR EH33 2A0 Lothian EH21 7DB EH21 7JU EH21 6HJ East Lothian, EH32 1NL

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

This information is not held*.

*In view of this, under Section 17(1)(b) of the Act, | must formally advise you that East Lothian Council has been unable to comply with your request as the information you require is not held.
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