
Please include:

1.  Full names of deceased persons, Adam Anderson
2.  Dates of death 26 January 2018
3.  Marital status, This information is not held*.
4.  Maiden surnames of married or widowed females N/A
5.  Dates of birth or ages at death, 18 December 1941

6.  Last known addresses, 
87 Summerfield Road, Dunbar, East Lothian, 
EH32 1NL

7.  Estimated value of estates, This information is not held*.
8.  Date(s) when the information was passed (or information that is about to be 
or likely to be passed) to THE NUHU, Q&LTR OR ANY OTHER 3RD PARTY This information is not held*.

*Under Section 17(1)(b) of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002, I must formally advise you that East Lothian Council has been unable to comply with this part of your request as the information you require is not held. 

Please could you kindly send me any information you may hold relating to public or welfare funerals and/or persons who have died with no known next of kin since 01/01/18 to the day of your reply. 

East Lothian Council
FOI Ref: 2018/274(483641)
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