
East Lothian Council 
 

FOI Ref: 2018/531186 
 
I would like to request the following information: 
 
1) The number of public toilets currently available in your local 
authority   
 
62 (including public conveniences and toilets in public buildings) 
 
2) The number of public toilets that were available as at the end of 
the financial year 1999/2000 
 
This information is not recorded.  In view of this, under Section 17(1)(b) of 
the Act, I must formally advise you that East Lothian Council has been 
unable to comply with this part of your request as the information you 
require is not held. 
 
If possible under cost limits,  
 
3) The number of public toilets that were available at the end of the 
following financial years: 2004/05; 2009/10; 2014/15. 
 
This information is not recorded.  In view of this, under Section 17(1)(b) of 
the Act, I must formally advise you that East Lothian Council has been 
unable to comply with this part of your request as the information you 
require is not held. 
 
The Council’s Facilities Management service have advised, however, that 
the number of public toilets has remained the same in recent years. 


