
East Lothian Council 
 

FOI Ref: 2018/537291 
 
 
Please provide: 
 
1. The numbers of students who have been in EHE (elective 
home education) for any period of the school year 2017/18. 
 
14 students 
 
Please also break this data down by the following additional 
subcategories (if recorded); 
 
i) reason for EHE  
 
Family decision (11) 
Exercised legal right under Section 30 of Education (Scotland) Act (3) 
 
i) gender, 
 
8 female 
6 male 
 
ii) ethnicity 
 
This information is not recorded*. 
 
iii) religion  
 
This information is not recorded*. 
 
*Under Section 17(1)(b) of the Act, I must formally advise you that East 
Lothian Council has been unable to comply with those parts of your request 
marked * as the information you require is not held. 
 


